
 
 
 

 
 

 
BROOKFIELD OAKTREE WEALTH SOLUTIONS FURTHERS GLOBAL 

EXPANSION WITH KEY EUROPEAN HIRES   
 
NEW YORK – April 6, 2023 – Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions, a leading provider of 
alternative investments to financial advisors and their clients globally, today announced three key 
European product development and client relationship management hires. 
 
Based in Zurich, Oliver Wiedemeijer joins as Managing Director, Product Development, and will 
be responsible for growing the Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions product suite alongside  
James Bruno, who joined from Morgan Stanley in January. Additionally, Andrew Downing and 
Alexandre Sabet have joined as Client Relationship Managers based in the United Kingdom and 
Switzerland, respectively. In their new roles, Downing and Sabet will be responsible for the 
execution of all sales, marketing, and investor relations-related activities relating to both public 
market and private market products for wealth management investors including independent 
wealth advisors, private banks, and multi-family offices. 
 
“On behalf of Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions, I welcome Oliver, Alex, and Andrew to the 
team,” said David Levi, Head of Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions. “Joining with a wealth of 
knowledge and industry experience, they will be crucial to our success as we continue to offer 
and develop innovative alternative solutions for financial advisors, private banks, and 
intermediaries globally.”  
 
Wiedemeijer joins Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions from Credit Suisse where he spent his 17-
year career. Most recently, he served as Global Head Fund Partnerships & Due Diligence for the 
firm’s Private Markets Group Liquid Alternatives, leading global content creation, fund selection, 
and product development across semiliquid private assets including private equity, private credit, 
real estate, infrastructure, and hedge funds. Prior to that, he was the Head of Liquid Alternatives 
for Credit Suisse in Asia Pacific, which included leading business development and investment 
strategy throughout the region.  
 
Downing joins Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions from Invesco Asset Management where he 
most recently served as Associate Director of Global Banks, Asset Managers, Discretionary 
Wealth, and Family Offices. In the role, he led relationships with research teams and banking 
partners at private banks and wealth managers. Prior to that, he was a Regional Sales Manager 
supporting the Middle East and North Africa regions.  
 
Sabet joins Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions from Lombard Odier, where he held the role of 
Chief Operating Officer, Investment Solutions. Prior to Lombard Odier, Sabet was responsible for 
client management across institutional and private wealth channels in Switzerland, France, 
Monaco, Israel, and the Benelux for PIMCO. He also held roles at Bain & Company and BNP 
Paribas.  
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Advisors interested in learning more about Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions should call +1 
(855) 777-8001 or email info@brookfieldoaktree.com. 
 
About Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions 
Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions is a leading provider of alternative investments to advisors 
and their clients globally, helping them meet their overall financial goals. The global scale and 
multi-decade track records of our parent companies, Brookfield and Oaktree, place us among the 
leaders in alternative investing. For more information, please visit our website at 
www.brookfieldoaktree.com. Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions is registered as a broker-dealer 
with the U.S. Securities & Exchange Commission (“SEC”) and is a member of Financial Industry 
Regulatory Authority, Inc.) (“FINRA”) and the Securities Investor Protection Corporation (“SIPC”). 
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