
 

Page 1 of 7 
 

This communication is for stockholder use only and is not an offer to sell or a 
solicitation of an offer to buy any securities.  

 
Brookfield Real Estate Income Trust, Inc. (“Brookfield REIT”)  

Q2 2025 Podcast Transcript 
Recorded on July 23, 2025 

 
Introduction: Before we get started, it is our obligation to give you some important information. 
 
Any comments made on this podcast may include forward looking statements. These statements 
that relate to future results and events are based on current expectations. Actual results in future 
periods may differ materially from those currently expected because of a number of risks, 
uncertainties and assumptions. The risks, uncertainties and assumptions that we believe are 
material are outlined in publicly accessible regulatory filings. 
 
All investing involves risk. The value of an investment will fluctuate over time, and an investor may 
gain or lose money or the entire investment. Past performance is no guarantee of future results. 
 
A fund’s investment objectives, risks, charges and expenses must be considered carefully before 
investing. The prospectus contains this and other important information about the investment 
company, and it may be obtained by visiting www.brookfieldoaktree.com  
 
Read the prospectus carefully before investing. 
 
This podcast is for direct and indirect stockholders of Brookfield Real Estate Income Trust. 
 
Dana Petitto (Dana): Hello everyone, and welcome to the next edition of our Manager Minute 
Podcast for Brookfield REIT for the quarter ended June 30th, 2025. We began this new podcast 
format earlier this year, making this our second episode, and we really appreciate the interest of 
those who have tuned in. My name is Dana Petitto. I'm a managing director in the real estate group 
at Brookfield Asset Management, and I serve as the chief operating officer and portfolio manager 
for Brookfield REIT, which is the organization's public non-listed real estate income trust. 
 
On today's episode, I'm very excited to be joined by Lowell Baron, a longtime Brookfield veteran and 
newly named global CEO of our real estate business. Lowell, congratulations on your recent 
appointment as real estate CEO, and thanks so much for joining us this quarter on the Brookfield 
REIT Podcast. 
 
Lowell Baron (Lowell): Thank you, and thank you so much for having me. 
 
Dana: Great. So before we delve into an in-depth discussion with Lowell on the state of play in the 
real estate industry, both for Brookfield Asset Management Ltd. (“Brookfield”) and the market in 
general, I'll first provide a quick summary of the quarterly performance and new activity and 
initiatives within Brookfield REIT. In Q2 2025, we generated a net total return of 1.1% on our Class I 
shares, a strong quarter in which we reported positive returns in each of the past 3 months. 
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Our annualized distribution rate on Class I shares of 6.8% is at the high end of our peer group. 
Notably, all of our distributions to stockholders since inception of the fund dating back to 
December, 2019, have been characterized as return of capital. On a tax equivalent basis, the 
annualized yield on Class I shares is nearly 11%. This is a highly attractive, stable source of recurring 
income, especially in consideration of a more volatile and uncertain bond and equity market. 
 
The operating performance of our $2.5 billion portfolio remains strong. As of June 30, portfolio 
occupancy stands at 95%. The weighted average lease term in our commercial portfolio is about 
eight years, and the in-place leases are backed by a roster of primarily investment grade credit 
tenants. In addition, most of these leases have annual rent increases built in. And in our residential 
portfolio, we continue to drive rent and ancillary rent revenue growth, while also reducing expenses 
by utilizing our adviser’s best in class operating platforms in multifamily single family rental and 
student housing. 
 
In the first half of this year, we've been very active on the acquisitions front, having deployed or 
committed to approximately $230 million of capital into both real estate equity and credit 
investments that are expected to deliver core plus returns. Following last quarter's podcast where I 
spoke to Devin Barnwell, co-head of Brookfield's Global Logistics business about a recent 
transaction we closed and the logistics sector landscape more broadly. This quarter in June, 
Brookfield REIT acquired a 20% interest in a 3.6 million square foot portfolio of multi-tenant logistics 
buildings, strategically located across four Premier Sun Belt markets, allowing us to scale our 
logistics exposure while maintaining geographic and asset diversification. This portfolio carries 96% 
occupancy and a weighted average lease term of 2.7 years. 
 
Shorter lease term logistics assets are more attractive in today's environment given pent-up rent 
growth due to strong demand and lack of new competitive supply being delivered. Additionally, it 
provides flexibility to further exit assets early upon realization of the in-place mark-to-market [rents]. 
As I mentioned, these are multi-tenanted buildings and are on the smaller side with an average 
building size of about 64,000 square feet. Supply growth in this particular segment of the industrial 
space is the tightest in the market. We estimate that the acquisition basis here was about a 25% 
discount to recent comparable market trades, a 40% discount to peak trades, and a 38% discount 
to replacement cost. 
 
Based on in-place rents in the portfolio today, there is an embedded 29% mark-to-market rent 
opportunity, which we believe should result in strong appreciation. Despite our lower bid for the 
entire portfolio compared to some of the parts offers received by the seller, we were chosen for our 
reputation, ability to execute quickly and certainty of closing on the full portfolio. Following closing 
of this transaction, we now have a 16% sector allocation to logistics, which is an increase from 5% 
coming into 2025. With all of that covered, we'll turn to our guest speaker, Lowell Baron. Welcome 
again, Lowell. 
 
Lowell: Thank you. 
 
Dana: Coincidentally, you and I both joined Brookfield 20 years ago. For veterans like us, it's been 
remarkable how much the company has grown and evolved over those two decades. During this 
time, we've experienced several real estate cycles. Where would you say we are in the current 
market cycle and what brings you optimism today? 
 



 

Page 3 of 7 

Lowell: Thanks, Dana. It's a good question and it's also a great opportunity for you to make us both 
feel pretty old. 
 
Dana: It's true. 
 
Lowell: Obviously, we've been through a number of cycles in those 20 years, and even before that, 
I'd seen a couple of cycles previous, and I'd say every one of them is different. They all feel different. 
In this one, I think we're pretty early on. If I was putting it to innings, I would say we're probably in the 
second inning, something like that, and pretty excited about it because if you think about where we 
are, number one, we've had a pretty significant repricing of assets. So asset values today are at a 
pretty healthy discount to where they were at the recent peak. We also are experiencing really good 
fundamentals. 
 
So if you think about just simple supply and demand for real estate, which is what it all comes down 
to, we're in a place where there's a lot less new supply happening. Construction starts are way 
down, and demand for the asset classes that we're investing in is very strong. Probably one of the 
most important points to look at, and you just mentioned it on the industrial portfolio you just 
bought, is thinking about values today versus replacement costs. And when you can buy high 
quality industrial like we're doing at almost 40% below replacement cost, that's a really great starting 
point, and it's something you typically would see only really in the early innings of a recovery. 
 
Dana: Yeah. That's right, and we are really excited about that acquisition, and it follows suit 
characteristically to the one that we spoke about last quarter. So we've been very active in 
multifamily and in logistics, which are two sectors, which I think have a lot of tailwinds going for them 
right now, especially given the lack of new supply as you just mentioned. So what, if any, are some 
concerns you might have today? 
 
Lowell: Yeah. Look, I think the place that everyone probably would point to is geopolitical risk. It's 
obviously very difficult to underwrite or to predict, but it certainly feels like we're in an incredibly 
volatile world. You never know what the headline might be the next day. The good thing is what 
we're doing, investing in real estate, real estate's a long-term game. We invest in assets that we're 
going to hold for a longer period of time, and so just being in a place where the fundamentals are 
good and where the starting basis is so good, as we talked about relative to replacement cost, just 
lets us have the ability to see through that near-term uncertainty and volatility and recognize that 
we're buying assets that we're going to hold through this. And when we get to the point where we're 
looking to exit assets, some of these headlines that everyone's talking about now, are going to be 
things we probably have fully forgotten and won't really matter. 
 
Dana: The noise sometimes clouds the long-term goal here, and that's something we try to stress 
when we're sitting in front of our investor base. 
 
Lowell: And it also creates the opportunity, I would say. A lot of people do react to that noise, and so 
it creates the opportunity to then, for us, when we think with a longer term outlook, it creates for us 
the opportunity to go buy from others that may have weaker hands and need that liquidity and 
aren't ready to ride through a bit of volatility. 
 
Dana: And that's exactly what we started to see last year, so couldn't agree more. When we think 
about fundraising and the potential there, so historically, our sponsored private real estate funds 
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have catered more toward institutional investors and the size of those funds has grown significantly 
over the last 15 years or so. How much runway, in your view, do you think there is for growth within 
private wealth for incremental allocations to private real estate and other alts moving away from 
more traditional equity bond portfolios? 
 
Lowell: Yeah. This is obviously a very timely question. It's something we're seeing and hearing about 
in the news quite a bit too. I think we're still early in that as well, and there's going to be significant 
growth in private wealth, getting access to private real estate. I think private real estate has probably 
an important place in most investors’ allocations of how they invest their portfolios. So giving people 
broader and easier access to that is a good thing. One of the interesting things I think about, 
because this question comes up and people ask, does it make sense to give people that kind of 
allocation? Does it fit in with their risk profile? It's interesting. 
 
We have, as you mentioned, most of our investors in our broader portfolio, our institutional real 
estate investors, their large institutions, but if you actually think about who they are, a lot of them are 
big pensions. They're essentially investing the pensions of firefighters and teachers who are 
therefore getting access to private real estate just through their pensions. And really the question to 
ask is why should they be getting access to that and earning those higher returns with lower risk, 
and not everybody else in their 401(K). It should be something that's available to anybody, and 
especially with their longer term capital that's sitting there that needs to grow for their retirements. 
We should be able to get everyone access to it and make sure that people invest to the right 
amount, have the right allocation to it, but it should be a great part of their portfolio. 
 
Dana: Yeah. There's a lot of runway there with individual investors exposing themselves more to 
alternatives. That's definitely what we've seen. When we speak with financial advisors and their 
clients, we often tout the benefits of Brookfield's owner operator model and the capabilities given 
Brookfield’s historical roots as a vertically integrated real estate investor, which began before you 
and I started here, almost 30 years ago on the balance sheet. I know how that goes in the private 
sector with some of the clients that I'm speaking to. How does that resonate with our largest 
institutional LPs that have done repeat? And I guess in your view, and based on your tenure, would 
you say that this has had a material impact on our returns and ability to outperform? 
 
Lowell: Yeah. So when I sit with our institutional investors, I'd say there's a number of things that we 
point out as differentiators. Some of those are things like the scale of our business or the amount of 
experience and the history of our business, how long we've been doing it for, but probably the thing 
that is the most interesting to them that really they view as the true differentiator is our operating 
capabilities. And it's about having full service operating platforms in all of the sectors, in all the 
markets that we're investing in. Our 30,000 Brookfield operating employees are incredibly powerful 
and people understand and recognize that, and I would say it's more than just people recognizing it, 
but to your point, how does it come through in our returns? Really everything that we're buying has 
a business plan attached to it. 
 
So we are operations led in what we buy and then operations led and how we generate our returns. 
It's not about financial leverage creating the returns. It's not about multiple expansion that we're 
relying on to create returns. It's literally just about what are we doing with the assets, how do we 
grow occupancy, how do we grow rent, how do we manage expenses? And bottom line is we just 
need to grow our cash flows, and if you grow your cash flows of your real estate, you're growing 
those values. So that turns into, for us, I think probably most importantly, consistency of returns. So 
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across cycles, we can create those kinds of returns, whether it's an up cycle or a down cycle, and it 
just makes it. So what we're doing is actually quite simple. We're just out executing prescribed 
business plans in every asset and growing our cash flow. Once we've done that, we can go and sell 
the asset and make a good return. 
 
Dana: Yeah. That's great. Well, Lowell, thank you. I think we covered a lot of ground and we really 
appreciate your insights, your knowledge, your look to the future and being in that second inning 
with a lot of way to go. So thanks for joining me. To our listeners, thanks for tuning in. We really 
appreciate your support and look forward to updating you in a few months on the next Manager 
Minute for Q3. Thanks so much.  
 
As of June 30, 2025.  
 
This stockholder update does not constitute tax advice. Because each investor’s tax position is 
different, you should consult with your tax advisor. Other investments may offer tax advantages. An 
accelerated depreciation schedule does not guarantee a profitable return on investment. A portion 
of REIT distributions may be tax deferred given the ability to characterize ordinary income as Return 
of Capital (“ROC”). ROC distributions reduce the stockholder’s tax basis in the year the dividend is 
received, and generally defer taxes on that portion until the stockholder’s stock is sold via 
redemption. Certain non-cash deductions, such as depreciation and amortization, lower the 
taxable income for REIT distributions. Investors should be aware that a REIT’s ROC percentage may 
vary significantly in a given year and, as a result, the impact of the tax law and any related 
advantages may vary significantly from year to year. Brookfield REIT’s return of capital was 100% in 
2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 and 2023. This assumes the maximum effective tax rate on distributions is 
0% and assumes the maximum ordinary tax bracket of 37%. Please note the effective tax rate is 
after the 20% reduction in rates introduced under the Tax Cuts and Jobs Act of 2017. The Tax Cuts 
and Jobs Act of 2017 is not applicable to capital gain dividends or certain qualified dividend income. 
It is only available for qualified REITs. There may be adverse legislative or regulatory tax changes. 
Brookfield REIT cannot guarantee that it will make distributions, and if it does it may fund such 
distributions from sources other than cash flow from operations, including, without limitation, the 
sale of assets, borrowings, return of capital or offering proceeds, and advances, and it has no limits 
on the amounts it may pay from such sources. Distributions may also be funded in significant part, 
directly or indirectly, from the deferral of certain investment advisory fees, that may be subject to 
repayment to Brookfield REIT Adviser LLC (the “Adviser”) and/or the reimbursement of certain 
operating expenses, that may be subject to repayment to its Adviser and its affiliates. For the 
portion of the Adviser’s management fee that is paid in stock, Brookfield REIT's cash position would 
not be reduced by that amount at that time but will be reduced in a future period, when the Adviser 
requests the repurchase of its stock for cash and such request is granted. For organizational and 
offering expenses paid by the Adviser on behalf of the Issuer prior to July 6, 2023, the Issuer 
reimburses the Adviser ratably over 60 months and this practice may have a smoothing effect on 
the Issuer’s cash position and/or distribution payment amounts. Distributions are not guaranteed 
and may be sourced from non-income items. The illustrative example assumes $100,000 
investment and a maximum ordinary tax bracket of 37%. It does not include state taxes. Investors 
could be subject to state income tax in their state of residence which would lower the after tax 
distribution received by the investor. The illustrative example does not reflect the impact of 
increasing net operating income (“NOI”); an increasing NOI from higher rents would reduce the 
amount of ROC. Past performance is not indicative of future results. Tax-Equivalent Distribution 
Rate does not take into account other taxes that may be owed on an investment in Brookfield REIT 
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when the investor redeems their shares. Upon redemption, the investor may be subject to higher 
capital gains taxes as a result of a depreciating cost basis due to the return of capital portion of 
distributions. 
 
Brookfield REIT Class S and Class D shares monthly net distributions were $0.0523 and $0.0574, 
and monthly net distribution rates were 5.9% and 6.4%, respectively. 
 
All investment information can be provided to the investor upon request. The case study 
discussions are provided for informational purposes only and are intended to illustrate the 
investment process. Does not constitute a recommendation nor investment advice and should not 
be used as the basis for any investment decision. This is not a representation that an investment in 
the securities described were or will be profitable. 
 
IMPORTANT INFORMATION  
All investing involves risk. The value of an investment will fluctuate over time, and an investor may 
gain or lose money, or the entire investment. Past performance is no guarantee of future results.  
 
The information contained herein is for educational and informational purposes only and does not 
constitute, and should not be construed as, an offer to sell, or a solicitation of an offer to buy, any 
securities or related financial instruments. Further this communication does not constitute and 
should not be construed as are commendation or testimonial for any securities, related financial 
instruments, products or services of Brookfield Corporation (“Brookfield”) and certain of its affiliates.  
This commentary discusses broad market, industry or sector trends, or other general economic or 
market conditions, and it is being provided on a confidential basis. Views and opinions expressed 
are subject to change.   

The case study discussions are for informational purposes only and intended to illustrate the 
investment process. They do not constitute a recommendation or investment advice and should 
not be the basis for any investment decision. This is not a representation that an investment in the 
described securities was or will be profitable. 

FORWARD-LOOKING STATEMENTS 
Information herein contains, includes or is based on forward-looking statements. Forward-looking 
statements include all statements, other than statements of historical fact, that address future 
activities, events or developments, including, without limitation, business or investment strategy or 
measures to implement strategy, competitive strengths, goals, expansion and growth of our 
business, plans, prospects, and references to our future success. You can identify these statements 
by the fact that they do not relate strictly to historical or current facts. Words such as “anticipate,” 
“estimate,” “expect,” “project,” “intend,” “plan,” “believe,” “seek” and other similar words are intended 
to identify these forward-looking statements. Forward-looking statements can be affected by 
inaccurate assumptions or by known or unknown risks and uncertainties. Many such factors will be 
important in determining our actual future results or outcomes. Consequently, no forward-looking 
statement can be guaranteed. Our actual results or outcomes may vary materially. Given these 
uncertainties, you should not place undue reliance on these forward-looking statements. 
 
You should carefully review the “Risk Factors” section of the prospectus for a discussion of the risks 
and uncertainties that Brookfield REIT believes are material to its business, operating results, 
prospects and financial condition. Except as otherwise required by federal securities laws, 
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Brookfield REIT does not undertake to publicly update or revise any forward-looking statements, 
whether as a result of new information, future events or otherwise. 
 
Information herein may contain, include or be based upon forward-looking statements with the 
meaning of the federal securities laws, specifically Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 
1934, as amended. 
 
©2025 Brookfield Corporation; ©2025 Brookfield Asset Management Ltd.; ©2025 Oaktree Capital 
Management, L.P.; ©2025 Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions LLC; & ©2025 Brookfield Public 
Securities Group LLC. Brookfield Oaktree Wealth Solutions LLC and Brookfield Public Securities 
Group LLC are an indirect majority owned subsidiary of Brookfield Corporation. 


